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In this quirky, romantic novel, in the irreverent spirit of Christopher Moore’s national bestseller Lamb, a
young woman is getting texts from an iPhone-obsessed God, and she’s not okay with that. Her handsome
new neighbor tries to intervene in the dispute, but is he on her side, or the Almighty’s?

Patience Kelleher doesn’t want to be a soldier of the Lord. She doesn’t want His voice in her head, and she
certainly doesn’t want Him texting her emoticon-laden messages about boy band singers and sinister solar
power corporations. What would a cranky, twenty-three-year-old waitress know about preventing the
Apocalypse? He’s got believers for that sort of thing, or the Army. All Patience wants is to keep a job she
actually likes, and to avoid falling for her confounding new neighbor, if at all possible. When the Lord enlists
said neighbor to convince her to step up, it doesn’t brighten her mood. That was dirty pool.

Zane Grey Ellison doesn’t particularly want to be a soldier of the Lord either, but he’s keeping an open mind.
His world’s been pretty skewed since he abandoned his father’s estate, and his preoccupation with the
waitress across the street hasn’t helped him regain his equilibrium. The messages she’s receiving from a
text-happy God don’t seem all that much more wondrous to him than his discovery of diner food, or the
realization that not every girl in the world can be impressed by a Bugatti Veyron. In fact, if Patience would
just stop bickering with the Lord for a minute, he believes they might even get the job done.

Patience fights to keep her sanity as Zane fights to keep the peace, determined not to let the world die…not
when it’s just getting good.
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From reader reviews:

Cindi Russell:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand up than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you that Patience, My Dear book as beginning
and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Henry Taylor:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era that is certainly always change and advance. Some
of you maybe can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Patience, My Dear is
our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need
in this era.

Richard Broderick:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to
imagine the story how the personas do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others.
When you read this Patience, My Dear, it is possible to tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours
guide. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Steven Jones:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and soul
or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time
there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring along with
can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we
know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Patience, My Dear can make you really feel more interested to read.
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