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CORRECTION:

Regarding the book, The Battle for Paradise by Jeremy Evans, the following correction has been made on
page 163 in paragraph three (3) to wit:

“Weston once worked in concert with government officials in a pre-planned sting operation, complete with
marked bills: Weston, whose role in the operation involved paying a bribe to the Golfito mayor for a
concession and then documenting the bribe as a way to expose the mayor as a corrupt government official,
was a former cocaine dealer, according to Dan, and someone who illegally acquired possession of his
sawmill property.”

Pavones, a town located on the southern tip of Costa Rica, is a haven for surfers, expatriates, and fishermen
seeking a place to start over. Located on the Golfo Dulce (Sweet Gulf), a marine sanctuary and one of the
few tropical fjords in the world, Pavones is home to a legendary surf break and a cottage fishing industry.
 
In 2004 a multinational company received approval to install the world’s first yellowfin tuna farm near the
mouth of the Golfo Dulce. The tuna farm as planned would pollute the area, endanger sea turtles, affect the
existing fish population, and threaten the world-class wave. A lawsuit was filed just in time, and the project
was successfully stalled. Thus began an unlikely alliance of local surfers, fishermen, and global
environmental groups to save a wave and one of the most biodiverse places on the planet.
 
In The Battle for Paradise, Jeremy Evans travels to Pavones to uncover the story of how this ragtag group
stood up to a multinational company and how a shadowy figure from the town’s violent past became an
unlikely hero. In this harrowing but ultimately inspiring story, Evans focuses in turn on a colorful cast of
characters with an unyielding love for the ocean and surfing, a company’s unscrupulous efforts to expand
profits, and a government that nearly sold out the perfect wave.
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From reader reviews:

Alma Miranda:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by interact with the internet
and the resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each information they get. How
many people to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book.
Examining a book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information mainly this The Battle for
Paradise: Surfing, Tuna, and One Town's Quest to Save a Wave book because this book offers you rich facts
and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably
know this.

Ruth Ford:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the information
about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are
many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their expertise in writing,
they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this The Battle for Paradise:
Surfing, Tuna, and One Town's Quest to Save a Wave.

Alex Tipton:

The book untitled The Battle for Paradise: Surfing, Tuna, and One Town's Quest to Save a Wave contain a
lot of information on this. The writer explains her idea with easy means. The language is very clear to see all
the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was published by famous author.
The author provides you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can please
read on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation
you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice
examine.

April Baker:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is published or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news. Within
this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social such
as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking the
The Battle for Paradise: Surfing, Tuna, and One Town's Quest to Save a Wave when you necessary it?
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