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The first edition (1975) was called "...a useful aid in locating biographical information on a specific female...
musician..." by the Music Educator's Journal. More than 4,000 entries were included. This new two-volume
edition is over five times the size of the original Women in Music Including many new titles that have been
published since the first editon that deal specifically with women musicians, this edition elaborates on the
expanding role of women music.

Like the 1975 edition, it serves as an index to the biographies of women musicians of all periods and
countries, as found in a representative selection of significant music, dictionaries, and encyclopedias. This
update also includes non-musical sources, such as general biographical sets, as well as references to
obituaries from significant newspapers and trade publications, notably the  New York Times , Times
(London), and Variety. The designation 'musician' is considered broadly, encompassing such ancillary
disciplines as music therapists, folklorists, librettists, etc.
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn Blow:

This Women in Music book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you receive by reading this book will be information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get
details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. That Women in Music without
we understand teach the one who looking at it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't possibly
be worry Women in Music can bring when you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn out to
be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Women in Music having
excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Melvin Wilhelm:

This book untitled Women in Music to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, honestly,
that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this
book in the book shop or you can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes
you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to
your account to past this reserve from your list.

Luther Keller:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Women in Music your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe
not known for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a book then
become one type conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get previous to. The Women in
Music giving you one more experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful facts for
your better life in this particular era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern the following is your
body and mind will be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try
this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Corey Cook:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this publication. This Women in Music is simple to
bring you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the
particular printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the actual
book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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