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The Deep South has seen a 36 percent increase in AIDS cases while the rest of the nation has seen a 2

percent decline. Many of the underlying reasons for the disease’s continued spread in the region—ignorance

about HIV, reluctance to get tested, non-adherence to treatment protocols, resistance to behavioral

changes—remain unaddressed by policymakers.

In this extensively revised second edition, Kathryn Whetten and Brian Wells Pence present a rich discussion

of twenty-five ethnographic life stories of people living with HIV in the South. Most importantly, they

incorporate research from their recent quantitative study, “Coping with HIV/AIDS in the Southeast”

(CHASE), which includes 611 HIV-positive patients from North Carolina, South Carolina, Georgia,

Alabama, and Louisiana. This new edition continues to bring the participants’ voices to life while

highlighting how the CHASE study confirmed many of the themes that originally emerged from the life

histories. This is the first cohesive compilation of up-to-date evidence on the unique and difficult aspects of

living with HIV in the Deep South.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Gatling:

The ability that you get from You're the First One I've Told: The Faces of HIV in the Deep South may be the
more deep you searching the information that hide inside the words the more you get serious about reading
it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but You're the First One I've Told: The Faces of HIV
in the Deep South giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in selected way
that can be understood by simply anyone who read that because the author of this guide is well-known
enough. This book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can
go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this
You're the First One I've Told: The Faces of HIV in the Deep South instantly.

Sandra Snyder:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, brief story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not trying You're the First One I've Told: The
Faces of HIV in the Deep South that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by reading this book.
Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world much better then how
they react toward the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading practice only for the geeky individual
but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as
your good habit, it is possible to pick You're the First One I've Told: The Faces of HIV in the Deep South
become your own starter.

Danny Miller:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to you is You're the First One I've Told: The Faces of HIV in the Deep South this publication
consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented
how does the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this book
acceptable all of you.

Mikel Davis:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
ok you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like You're the First One I've



Told: The Faces of HIV in the Deep South which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
find.
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