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This book covers the practical aspects of database design, data cleansing, data analysis, and data protection,
among others. The focus is on what you really need to know to create the right database for your small
business and to leverage it most effectively to spur growth and revenue.

Databases for Small Business is a practical handbook for entrepreneurs, managers, staff, and professionals in
small organizations who are not IT specialists but who recognize the need to ramp up their small
organizations’ use of data and to round out their own business expertise and office skills with basic database
proficiency.

Anna Manning—a data scientist who has worked on database design and data analysis in a computer science
university research lab, her own small business, and a nonprofit—walks you through the progression of steps
that will enable you to extract actionable intelligence and maximum value from your business data in terms
of marketing, sales, customer relations, decision making, and business strategy.

Dr. Manning illustrates the steps in the book with four running case studies of a small online business, an
engineering startup, a small legal firm, and a nonprofit organization.

What you’ll learn

Design a small business database from scratch●

Extract the maximum profit from your data●

Follow guidance on data protection law●

Effectively use data collection and data cleansing techniques●

Train staff to leverage your data●

Who this book is for

Databases for Small Business is a practical handbook for entrepreneurs, managers, staff, and professionals in
any small organization who are not IT specialists but who recognize the need to ramp up their small
organization's use of data and to round out their own and their staff's business expertise and office skills with
basic database proficiency.
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From reader reviews:

Tammi Kendrick:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work this is
difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside look likes.
Maybe you answer can be Databases for Small Business: Essentials of Database Management, Data
Analysis, and Staff Training for Entrepreneurs and Professionals why because the wonderful cover that make
you consider regarding the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is actually
fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Walter Miller:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Databases for Small Business: Essentials of
Database Management, Data Analysis, and Staff Training for Entrepreneurs and Professionals can be the
reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your time by
reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the
others?

Stephanie Dillard:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is referred to
as of book Databases for Small Business: Essentials of Database Management, Data Analysis, and Staff
Training for Entrepreneurs and Professionals. You can add your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

Stacie Logan:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just trying to find the Databases for Small Business: Essentials of Database Management, Data
Analysis, and Staff Training for Entrepreneurs and Professionals when you needed it?
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