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Geometry defines the world around us, helping us make sense of everything from architecture to military
science to fashion. And for over two thousand years, geometry has been equated with Euclid’s Elements,
arguably the most influential book in the history of mathematics In The King of Infinite Space, renowned
mathematics writer David Berlinski provides a concise homage to this elusive mathematician and his
staggering achievements. Berlinski shows that, for centuries, scientists and thinkers from Copernicus to
Newton to Einstein have relied on Euclid’s axiomatic system, a method of proof still taught in classrooms
around the world. Euclid’s use of elemental logic—and the mathematical statements he and others built from
it—have dramatically expanded the frontiers of human knowledge.

The King of Infinite Space presents a rich, accessible treatment of Euclid and his beautifully simple
geometric system, which continues to shape the way we see the world.
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From reader reviews:

Roxanne Jimenez:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled The King of Infinite Space: Euclid and His Elements. Try to face the
book The King of Infinite Space: Euclid and His Elements as your close friend. It means that it can to be
your friend when you really feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it
is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every thing
by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Mike Huey:

Book is usually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A guide The King of Infinite Space: Euclid
and His Elements will make you to always be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about everything. But some of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or
appropriate book with you?

Frances Wiggins:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously
which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen in you if you take The King of Infinite Space: Euclid and His Elements as the
daily resource information.

Beulah Chavez:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to
beach, or picnic inside the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to
something different to fill your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book can be option to fill
your no cost time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If
you want to attempt look for book, may be the book untitled The King of Infinite Space: Euclid and His
Elements can be good book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.
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