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This pioneering study looks at the effects of prenatal testosterone on postnatal development and behavior.
Hormonal effects on behavior have long been studied in animals; the unique contribution of this book is to
suggest a connection between human fetal hormones and later behavior. It details for the first time
testosterone's effect on social and language development, opening a new avenue of research for cognitive
neuroscience.The authors look at samples of amniotic fluid taken during amniocentesis at 16 weeks'
gestation, and relate the fetal level of testosterone (which is present in fetuses of both sexes, although in
different quantities) to behavior at ages 1, 2, and 4 years. They argue that the amniotic fluid provides a
window into the child's past -- a chemical record of that child's time in the womb -- that allows informed
prediction about the child's future brain, mind, and behavior. This is not the retrospective speculation of
psychoanalysis, they point out, but an opportunity to study development prospectively and trace
developmental precursors and causes of later cognition.The study suggests that prenatal levels of testosterone
affect a range of later behaviors in children, from the inclination to make eye contact with others to the size
of the vocabulary. It also suggests that prenatal testosterone level may be related to the development of
typically "masculine" and "feminine" behaviors. The study's ongoing research explores whether fetal
testosterone has any link with the risk of developing autism. Connecting endocrinology and psychology, the
authors propose that there is a biological component to behaviors often thought to be produced by the social
environment.
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From reader reviews:

Augustus Chase:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Next
to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Prenatal Testosterone in Mind: Amniotic Fluid
Studies (MIT Press) will make you to become smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored. It is not make you
fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Steven Simon:

This book untitled Prenatal Testosterone in Mind: Amniotic Fluid Studies (MIT Press) to be one of several
books this best seller in this year, that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit into it.
You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retailer or you can order it by using online. The
publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book
in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Alejandro Wisdom:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your short time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time
to be go through. Prenatal Testosterone in Mind: Amniotic Fluid Studies (MIT Press) can be your answer as
it can be read by you actually who have those short free time problems.

Tyler Dean:

Beside this kind of Prenatal Testosterone in Mind: Amniotic Fluid Studies (MIT Press) in your phone, it
could give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you
might got here is fresh from oven so don't become worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow
town. It is good thing to have Prenatal Testosterone in Mind: Amniotic Fluid Studies (MIT Press) because
this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you at times have book but you do not get
what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable
option here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this?
Find this book along with read it from now!
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