
The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in
America

Louis Menand

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B000OI1AF2
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B000OI1AF2
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B000OI1AF2


The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America

Louis Menand

The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America Louis Menand

The Metaphysical Club is the winner of the 2002 Pulitzer Prize for History.

A riveting, original book about the creation of modern American thought.

The Metaphysical Club was an informal group that met in Cambridge, Massachusetts, in 1872, to talk about
ideas. Its members included Oliver Well Holmes, Jr., future associate justice of the United States Supreme
Court; William James, the father of modern American psychology; and Charles Sanders Peirce, logician,
scientist, and the founder of semiotics. The Club was probably in existence for about nine months. No
records were kept. The one thing we know that came out of it was an idea -- an idea about ideas. This book is
the story of that idea. Holmes, James, and Peirce all believed that ideas are not things "out there" waiting to
be discovered but are tools people invent -- like knives and forks and microchips -- to make their way in the
world. They thought that ideas are produced not by individuals, but by groups of individuals -- that ideas are
social. They do not develop according to some inner logic of their own but are entirely depent -- like germs -
- on their human carriers and environment. And they thought that the survival of any idea deps not on its
immutability but on its adaptability. The Metaphysical Club is written in the spirit of this idea about ideas. It
is not a history of philosophy but an absorbing narrative about personalities and social history, a story about
America. It begins with the Civil War and s in 1919 with Justice Holmes's dissenting opinion in the case of
U.S. v. Abrams-the basis for the constitutional law of free speech. The first four sections of the book focus
on Holmes, James, Peirce, and their intellectual heir, John Dewey. The last section discusses some of the
fundamental twentieth-century ideas they are associated with. This is a book about a way of thinking that
changed American life.
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From reader reviews:

Avril Morris:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys that aren't like that. This The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America book is readable by
means of you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
regarding The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America content conveys the thought easily to
understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different such
as it. So , do you still thinking The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America is not loveable to be
your top record reading book?

Lila Johnson:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specifically book entitled The
Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering
in each aspect that maybe not known for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
book then become one web form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get previous to. The
The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America giving you yet another experience more than blown
away your head but also giving you useful information for your better life on this era. So now let us teach
you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished
reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Margaret Padua:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to share. You
can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You can observe
that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended for you is
The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America this e-book consist a lot of the information from the
condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language
styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some investigation when
he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.

Mario Davis:

A lot of people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when they get a
half parts of the book. You can choose often the book The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America
to make your reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading expertise is developing when you just
like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the feeling about
book and studying especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to start a book and study it. Beside
that the publication The Metaphysical Club: A Story of Ideas in America can to be your brand new friend



when you're experience alone and confuse using what must you're doing of these time.
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