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The crime takes place late one night in the mansion of Illinois Governor-elect Maitland Ashmore. His only
son, Day, is bludgeoned to death, gruesomely slaughtered in his own bed. This is a textbook murder—no
witnesses, no apparent motives, not a single clue. Or so it seems. This is a crime only a sharp, calculating
mind could have planned. And only a true student of crime can solve.
Jack Journey is that student. Author of a syndicated crime column, he is intimately familiar with all the
famous crimes of the past. But when Governor Ashmore asks him to act as press liaison on the case, Journey
is thrust into the middle of an all-too-real crime of the present. Soon it is clear that Journey must do more
than simply record the facts of this case in his column. He must find the killer in order to protect his own life.
Intricately plotted and paced, A Crime Story takes us through a thrilling maze of twists and turns. Jay Robert
Nash has created a world where there is danger in even the most innocent encounter, mystery behind every
closed door. Rarely has an author lent such convincing authenticity to a novel of mystery and suspense.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Rios:

The book A Crime Story gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make
your capable much more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having
big problem together with your subject. If you can make reading a book A Crime Story to get your habit, you
can get far more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. You may know everything if you like wide open and read a e-book A Crime Story. Kinds of book
are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this
guide?

Raymond Hollander:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their spare time with
their family, or their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try look for
book, may be the guide untitled A Crime Story can be excellent book to read. May be it can be best activity
to you.

Georgette Tang:

You may spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This A Crime Story is simple to develop you
can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the actual
printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the particular book in
your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Gwendolyn Mullins:

This A Crime Story is fresh way for you who has curiosity to look for some information given it relief your
hunger info. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having
tiny amount of digest in reading this A Crime Story can be the light food in your case because the
information inside this specific book is easy to get through anyone. These books build itself in the form that
is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in e-book form make
them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a e-book
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss
that! Just read this e-book sort for your better life and knowledge.
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