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English food is much more varied than fish 'n' chips (though we can tell you where to get the best London
has to offer). Indeed, England's capital city is home to a dizzying array of culinary options and of course
Angelika Taschen has selected the finest London eateries where you'll delight in a meal, tea, or simply
hobnobbing with the jet-set. Highlights of this book include descriptions of: The Golden Hind with its art
deco interior and delectable fish 'n' chips - a fixture on Marylebone Lane since 1914; The Wolseley, classic
grand cafe and perfect place for afternoon tea and scones; the same classic British cooking as Charles
Dickens once did at the city's oldest restaurant, Rules; London's first gastropub, The Eagle; La Fromagerie, a
cheese Mecca and delicatessen with fresh groceries; celebrity chef Jamie Oliver's restaurant, Fifteen. Special
features of this book include: exclusive hand-illustrated cover; exclusive hand-illustrated map for each area;
information such as opening hours, history, and signature dishes; hand-illustrated tear-out postcard; and,
softcover with a sturdy PVC jacket.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Price:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. These are reading whatever
they take because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like looking at a book?
Sometime, man feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or maybe exercise. Well, probably
you will need this London, Restaurants & More.

Jackie Lafond:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming
to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This London, Restaurants & More is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want
in this era.

Anthony Lucas:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This London, Restaurants & More book is readable simply by you
who hate those perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable looking at
experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer connected
with London, Restaurants & More content conveys objective easily to understand by lots of people. The
printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you nevertheless
thinking London, Restaurants & More is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Theresa Tompkins:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This London, Restaurants & More is
simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to
bring the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the book
in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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