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In CASTRO'S SECRETS, highly acclaimed author and intelligence expert Brian Latell offers a strikingly
original view of Fidel Castro in his role as Cuba's supreme spymaster. Based on interviews with high level
defectors from Cuba's powerful intelligence and security services, long-buried secrets of Fidel's nearly 50-
year reign are exposed for the first time. They include numerous assassinations and attempted ones carried
out on Castro's orders, some against foreign leaders. More than a dozen ranking Cuban secret agents
embraced by the CIA and FBI speak in these pages; some have never told their stories on the record before.
Latell also probes dispassionately into the CIA's most deplorable plots against Cuba - including previously
obscure schemes to assassinate Castro - and presents shocking new conclusions about what Fidel actually
knew of Lee Harvey Oswald prior to the assassination of John F. Kennedy.
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From reader reviews:

Martha Wilson:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this
Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy, you can tells your
family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them
reading a publication.

Thomas Murray:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and family or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day long to reading a
book. The book Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy it
is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These were enjoying
reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the e-book.
You can m0ore quickly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book
provides high quality.

Esther Belote:

This Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy is great e-
book for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who also always deal with
world and still have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it data accurately using great organize
word or we can point out no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have
whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the
Assassination of John F. Kennedy in your hand like finding the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous
one. We can say that no publication that offer you world with ten or fifteen minute right but this reserve
already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt which?

Scott Hicks:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose
the very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is identified



as of book Castro's Secrets: Cuban Intelligence, The CIA, and the Assassination of John F. Kennedy. You
can add your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you
actually happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one
place to other place.
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