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The Crusader tells the fascinating life story of Pat Buchanan, the three-time presidential candidate, Nixon
confidant, White House communications director during Iran-Contra, pundit, and bestselling author.

Buchanan is one of America's most controversial conservative rebels. After serving Nixon and Reagan, he
led a revolt against the Republican establishment that was a forerunner for the Tea Party. In 1992 he tried to
take away his party's nomination from the incumbent president, George H. W. Bush. Although he lost,
Buchanan set the tone for political debate for the next two decades when he declared a "cultural war" against
liberalism and a jihad on Republican moderates. Throughout the 1990s, his radical, rollicking presidential
campaigns tore apart the GOP and articulated the hopes and fears of a new generation of Middle American
conservatives.

This balanced, and often funny, biography explores the highs and lows of Buchanan's career, from his
stunning victory in the 1996 New Hampshire primary to his humiliating "grudge match" against Donald
Trump in the 2000 Reform Party contest.

At its heart is a man who embodies the contradictions of the conservative movement: a wealthy bookworm
who branded himself as an everyman reactionary, a Republican insider who became a populist outsider, a
patriarch whose campaigns were directed by his sister, a socially unacceptable ideologue who won the
affection of liberals and conservatives alike—Rachel Maddow, Ralph Nader, Eugene McCarthy, Ron Paul,
even Mel Gibson.

Timothy Stanley tells the intimate story of the man who defined the culture war for a generation of
Americans with outrage and wit; the man who, when asked what he thought about gun control, replied, "I
think it's important to have a steady aim."
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From reader reviews:

Michael Jackson:

The Crusader: The Life and Tumultuous Times of Pat Buchanan can be one of your nice books that are good
idea. We all recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase your
knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The
article writer giving his/her effort that will put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing The
Crusader: The Life and Tumultuous Times of Pat Buchanan although doesn't forget the main stage, giving
the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource details that maybe you can be certainly one of it.
This great information can certainly drawn you into fresh stage of crucial considering.

Gerald Conway:

The book untitled The Crusader: The Life and Tumultuous Times of Pat Buchanan contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored
by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of literary works. You can read this book because
you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.

Christopher Pipkin:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Crusader: The Life and Tumultuous Times
of Pat Buchanan can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are thus out of date, spending
your time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the
others?

Margaret Holt:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library in order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has
reading's heart and soul or real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the
library. They go to right now there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is
not important, boring and also can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is
very important to suit your needs. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we want.
Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this The Crusader: The Life and
Tumultuous Times of Pat Buchanan can make you sense more interested to read.
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