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From Book 1:
As a newly minted Assistant U.S. Attorney in Washington, D.C., Anna Curtis has already developed thick
skin to deal with the brutality she encounters with her daily stack of domestic violence cases. Yet when
Laprea Johnson walks into Anna’s life—battered by her boyfriend on the morning after Valentine’s
Day—there’s something about this particular case that Anna can’t quite shake, something that reminds the
prosecutor of her own troubled past.

At the trial, Laprea makes a last-minute reversal, lying on the witness stand to free her boy-friend. Shortly
after he is freed, Anna is horrified to hear that Laprea’s body has been found in a trash heap. Hastily assigned
to prosecute the murder case alongside intimidating chief homicide prosecutor Jack Bailey, Anna’s heart
sinks when she learns that her own boyfriend, public defender Nick Wagner, is representing the accused.

Torn between bringing the killer to justice and saving her personal life, Anna makes a series of choices that
jeopardizes her career, her relationships, and her very life as she uncovers the shocking truth behind the
murder.

Weaving expert knowledge with deft storytelling, federal sex-crimes prosecutor and Harvard Law School
graduate Allison Leotta takes readers on a thrilling ride through D.C.’s criminal justice system. From the
back rooms of the U.S. Attorney’s Office and the flirtations and machinations of Washington’s Ivy League
lawyers to the struggles of its poorest citizens on the gritty streets of Anacostia, Law of Attraction is a
gripping debut from an exciting new talent.
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From reader reviews:

Marie Flynt:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim or goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they get because their hobby will be reading a book. What about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Anna Curtis Series (4 Book Series).

Charles Anthony:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Anna Curtis Series
(4 Book Series) which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Deborah Oneal:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and Anna Curtis Series (4 Book
Series) as well as others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the fantastic a book,
you feel want to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or even students especially.
Those books are helping them to increase their knowledge. In different case, beside science reserve, any
other book likes Anna Curtis Series (4 Book Series) to make your spare time considerably more colorful.
Many types of book like this one.

Ericka McCall:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled
update of news. On this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just looking for the Anna Curtis Series (4 Book Series) when you needed it?
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