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Analog Design and Simulation using OrCAD Capture and PSpice provides step-by-step instructions on how
to use the Cadence/OrCAD family of Electronic Design Automation software for analog design and
simulation. Organized into 22 chapters, each with exercises at the end, it explains how to start Capture and
set up the project type and libraries for PSpice simulation. It also covers the use of AC analysis to calculate
the frequency and phase response of a circuit and DC analysis to calculate the circuits bias point over a range
of values.
The book describes a parametric sweep, which involves sweeping a parameter through a range of values,
along with the use of Stimulus Editor to define transient analog and digital sources. It also examines the
failure of simulations due to circuit errors and missing or incorrect parameters, and discusses the use of
Monte Carlo analysis to estimate the response of a circuit when device model parameters are randomly
varied between specified tolerance limits according to a specified statistical distribution. Other chapters
focus on the use of worst-case analysis to identify the most critical components that will affect circuit
performance, how to add and create PSpice models, and how the frequency-related signal and dispersion
losses of transmission lines affect the signal integrity of high-speed signals via the transmission lines.
Practitioners, researchers, and those interested in using the Cadence/OrCAD professional simulation
software to design and analyze electronic circuits will find the information, methods, compounds, and
experiments described in this book extremely useful.

Provides both a comprehensive user guide, and a detailed overview of simulation●

Each chapter has worked and ready to try sample designs and provides a wide range of to-do exercises●

Core skills are developed using a running case study circuit●

Covers Capture and PSpice together for the first time●
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From reader reviews:

Roxie Spencer:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important for us. The book Analog Design and Simulation using OrCAD Capture and
PSpice seemed to be making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more
information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The publication Analog Design and Simulation using
OrCAD Capture and PSpice is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to be your friend
when you experience bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your publication. Try to make
relationship together with the book Analog Design and Simulation using OrCAD Capture and PSpice. You
never experience lose out for everything when you read some books.

Danielle Smith:

Precisely why? Because this Analog Design and Simulation using OrCAD Capture and PSpice is an
unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with
the secret this inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This
amazing book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your
proficiency and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I were you I will
go to the publication store hurriedly.

Irene Forrest:

Analog Design and Simulation using OrCAD Capture and PSpice can be one of your nice books that are
good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information.
The author giving his/her effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing Analog Design and
Simulation using OrCAD Capture and PSpice nevertheless doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader
the hottest in addition to based confirm resource information that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This
great information can easily drawn you into fresh stage of crucial pondering.

Lori McDonald:

The book untitled Analog Design and Simulation using OrCAD Capture and PSpice contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique. The language is very clear to
see all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read that. The book was written by famous author.
The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read
more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to
buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.
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