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A PRACTICAL QUICK-REFERENCE GUIDE TO CLINICAL ANESTHESIOLOGY--PERFECT
FOR THE OR AND ICU

This carry-anywhere handbook is concise yet comprehensive, adeptly covering the wide range of topics
encountered in the practice of anesthesiology. It is the perfect learning tool for trainees and an outstanding
reference for experienced anesthesiologists. Presented in full color, The Anesthesia Guide utilizes numerous
illustrations, diagrams, tables, and algorithms to impart must-know information on how specific cases should
be managed. Coverage includes drug dosages, monitoring, complications, and clinical pearls. An
international team of contributors ensures coverage of topics from a global perspective.

The Anesthesia Guide is divided into thirteen color-coded sections for ease of reference:

Preoperative●

Coexisting Disease●

Monitoring●

General Anesthesia●

Specific Procedures●

Cardiovascular and Thoracic●

Neuro●

Regional●

Acute Pain●

Pediatrics●

Obstetrics●

Critical Care●

Rapid Reference (includes important formulae, commonly used phrases in anesthesiology, BLS, ACLS,●

PALS, and management of malignant hyperthermia)
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From reader reviews:

Phillip Barker:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book.
These are reading whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person
who don't like studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will need this The Anesthesia Guide.

Theodore Huff:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice simply by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of The
Anesthesia Guide book as nice and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

India Mead:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving The Anesthesia Guide that give
your pleasure preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be
said as the opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react towards the world. It can't be
claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to end up
being success person. So , for every you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick The
Anesthesia Guide become your personal starter.

Mary Norman:

You will get this The Anesthesia Guide by look at the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might
to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not
only through written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era
such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your own personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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