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“That was the first time in my life I was happy…the happiest I ever would be. And I never told you.”

There’s always one moment in life that passes without you saying what you really wanted – needed – to. For
Ruth that day came after the death of her beloved husband Trip.

She and Trip had fitted together perfectly, right from the very start, and their marriage was filled with love,
happiness and travel. Determined to leave nothing unspoken, Trip has left ten letters, taking Ruth on one last
adventure - scattering his ashes in ten locations that have meaning for them both.

The letters take her on a journey across the world, but also back through her marriage, and the life she
thought they had shared.

They had been so happy. Hadn’t they?

At once heart-breaking and uplifting …prepare to smile through your tears. Farewell Trip is a must read.

Praise for Karin Dixon and Gary Twynam ‘A lovely, warm and affectionate read that I devoured in
one sitting’ – Bleach House Library

'I very much enjoyed Farewell Trip, I enjoyed getting to know Ruth and Trip, I enjoyed reading about their
lives together and of their memories in some wonderful places.' - Chick Lit Reviews

' It was so beautiful, so emotionally charged and damn hard to carry on at some points… It is a beautifully
written love story which will stay with me for a very long time. I loved every aspect about it, from the
characters to the places that Ruth travels too, and it was such a fantastic adventure, I'd definitely go on again
someday.' - Becca's Books 10/10
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From reader reviews:

Michael Madden:

The book Farewell Trip can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why
must we leave the best thing like a book Farewell Trip? Wide variety you have a different opinion about e-
book. But one aim in which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to
closer with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you can give for each other; you can share
all of these. Book Farewell Trip has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function for you.
You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Janet Maldanado:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or information even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Farewell Trip is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in
this era.

Johnny Allen:

This Farewell Trip is completely new way for you who has fascination to look for some information given it
relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or else you who
still having small amount of digest in reading this Farewell Trip can be the light food for yourself because
the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books build itself in the form
which is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in book form
make them feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is no in reading a publication especially
this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss this! Just
read this e-book kind for your better life as well as knowledge.

Carole Arehart:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book Farewell Trip was colourful and of course has pictures
around. As we know that book Farewell Trip has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until young adults.
For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore ,
not at all of book are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best
book for you and try to like reading in which.
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