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It’s “the nuclear bomb of racial epithets,” a word that whites have employed to wound and degrade African
Americans for three centuries. Paradoxically, among many black people it has become a term of affection
and even empowerment. The word, of course, is nigger, and in this candid, lucidly argued book the
distinguished legal scholar Randall Kennedy traces its origins, maps its multifarious connotations, and
explores the controversies that rage around it.

Should blacks be able to use nigger in ways forbidden to others? Should the law treat it as a provocation that
reduces the culpability of those who respond to it violently? Should it cost a person his job, or a book like
Huckleberry Finn its place on library shelves? With a range of reference that extends from the Jim Crow
south to Chris Rock routines and the O. J. Simpson trial, Kennedy takes on not just a word, but our laws,
attitudes, and culture with bracing courage and intelligence.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Williams:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Nigger: The Strange Career of a Troublesome Word. Try to
make book Nigger: The Strange Career of a Troublesome Word as your close friend. It means that it can to
be your friend when you really feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever before.
Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know
everything by the book. So , we should make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Contessa Watkins:

The book Nigger: The Strange Career of a Troublesome Word make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
need to use to make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting pressure
or having big problem using your subject. If you can make reading a book Nigger: The Strange Career of a
Troublesome Word to become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own capable,
increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You can know everything if you like wide open and
read a reserve Nigger: The Strange Career of a Troublesome Word. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science guide or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this publication?

Benjamin Munk:

The particular book Nigger: The Strange Career of a Troublesome Word will bring one to the new
experience of reading a book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new
book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book Nigger: The Strange Career of a Troublesome
Word is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can
quickly to read the book.

Arthur Faust:

You could spend your free time to see this book this e-book. This Nigger: The Strange Career of a
Troublesome Word is simple bringing you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and also soon. If
you did not include much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is
make you quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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