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In the first English-language biography of one of the most important figures in postwar German history,
Alfred C. Mierzejewski examines the life and service of Ludwig Erhard (1897-1977), West Germany's first
minister of economics and second chancellor. Erhard liberalized the German economy in 1948 and is
generally considered the father of West Germany's "economic miracle--the period of extraordinary growth in
jobs and improvement in the standard of living in the 1950s that helped stabilize Germany's first successful
democracy.

While recent scholarship has dismissed Erhard's influence on Germany's economic recovery, Mierzejewski
returns to little-cited German analyses and Erhard's own record and concludes that Allied currency reform
and Erhard's liberalization of the economy were crucial triggers for Germany's unprecedented economic
boom. Mierzejewski provides insight into Erhard's policies, his ideas, his character, and his relationships
with Konrad Adenauer and Charles de Gaulle. By offering a fresh account of Erhard's career as a leader in
postwar West Germany, Mierzejewski provides a deeper understanding of Germany's economy as well as its
democracy.
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From reader reviews:

Samuel Brooks:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Ludwig Erhard: A Biography as your daily
resource information.

Shaun Richards:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write
about the knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try
to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of them
is this Ludwig Erhard: A Biography.

Dora Dickey:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to you is Ludwig Erhard: A Biography this e-book consist a lot of the information from the
condition of this world now. This specific book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The
words styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he
makes this book. That's why this book ideal all of you.

Luis Gonzalez:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of
book Ludwig Erhard: A Biography. You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed
book, it could add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware
about e-book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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